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Recall Summary – European Toys 
 
 

EU Safety Gate Alerts (Mar 2022) 

Alert No. 
Notifying 
Country 

Product Product Photo Hazard/ Risk 
Measures 
Adopted 

A11/00035/22 Ireland Folding 
Bath Stand 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Injury 
Due to a faulty construction of the 
stand, a baby bath may fall through or 
tip over while in use, causing a baby 
falls to the ground and suffers from 
injury.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the General 
Product Safety Directive. 

Offer free 
safety strap to 
consumers to 
be added for a 
safer use to 
sold products 

A11/00039/22 Luxembourg Inflatable 
Activity 
Mat 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Suffocation 
The plastic bag of the packaging is too 
thin.  If a child plays with the packaging, 
the plastic could cover the mouth and 
nose, causing the child to suffocate.  
The product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A11/00041/22 Croatia Soft Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
The fibrous stuffing material of the toy 
is easily accessible due to the weakness 
of certain seams.  A child may put the 
stuffing material in the mouth and 
choke.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Ban on the 
marketing of 
the product 
and any 
accompanying 
measures 

A11/00042/22 Croatia Soft Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
The fibrous stuffing material of the toy 
is easily accessible due to the weakness 
of certain seams.  A child may put the 
stuffing material in the mouth and 
choke.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Import 
rejected at 
border 

A11/00044/22 Croatia Soft Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
The fibrous stuffing material of the toy 
is easily accessible due to the weakness 
of certain seams.  A child may put the 
stuffing material in the mouth and 
choke.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Import 
rejected at 
border 

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005604
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005679
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005709
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005717
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005721
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A11/00047/22 Ireland Toy Bow 
Set 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Damage to Sight 
The kinetic energy of the plastic balls 
shot from the bow is too high, which 
can lead to eye injury.  The product 
does not comply with the requirements 
of the Toy Safety Directive and the 
European standard EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A11/00049/22 Lithuania Electric 
Swing for 
Babies 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Injury 
The swing is not stable enough.  As a 
result, it can tip over and fall, causing 
injury to a child.  The product does not 
comply with the requirements of the 
General Product Safety Directive and 
the European standard EN 1273. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A11/00050/22 Poland Toy Guns 
Set 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
The foam projectiles are too small; a 
child playing with the toy may put the 
projectiles in the mouth and choke.  
The product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00352/22 Poland Plastic Doll 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical 
The plastic material of the toy contains 
an excessive amount of  
bis (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate (DEHP) 
(measured value:  up to 19.3% by 
weight).  This phthalate may harm the 
health of children, causing possible 
damage to their reproductive system.  
The product does not comply with the 
REACH Regulation. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00353/22 France Soft Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking, Suffocation 
Small parts (eyes) can easily detach.  A 
small child may put them in the mouth 
and choke.  The packaging, a plastic 
bag, is too thin and poses a suffocation 
risk.  The product does not comply with 
the requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A12/00354/22 The 
Netherlands 

Wooden 
Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
Small parts (the legs of the stop sign 
and traffic light) can easily detach. A 
small child may put them in the mouth 
and choke on them.  The product does 
not comply with the requirements of 
the Toy Safety Directive and the 
European standard EN 71-1. 

Warn 
consumers of 
the risks 

  

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005739
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005783
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005803
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005602
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10002972
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005670
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A12/00359/22 The 
Netherlands 

Cot 
 
(Country of 
Origin: The 
Netherlan
ds) 

 Entrapment, Injury, Strangulation, 
Suffocation 
The distance between the side slats is 
inadequate.  A child may get trapped in 
between and suffer from injury or 
strangulation.  The product does not 
comply with the European standard  
EN 716. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00362/22 Latvia Modeling 
Clay 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical 
The migration of boron from the toy 
clay is too high (measured value:  up to 
1785 mg/kg).  Ingestion or contact with 
an excessive quantity of boron may 
damage the reproductive system of 
children.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-3. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A12/00367/22 France Soft Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
Unknown) 

 Choking 
Small parts (metal fastener) may easily 
detach from the product.  Furthermore, 
the seam on the front right foot easily 
breaks, allowing access to the stuffing 
material.  A small child may put them in 
the mouth and choke.  The product 
does not comply with the requirements 
of the Toy Safety Directive and the 
European standard EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A12/00371/22 Luxembourg Plastic 
Bath Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical, Choking 
Small parts (the cap on the tube) can 
easily detach from the toy.  A small 
child may put them in the mouth and 
choke.  The plastic material of the 
product contains an excessive amount 
of bis (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate (DEHP) 
and dibutyl phthalate (DBP) (measured 
value:  0.58% and 10% by weight 
respectively).  These phthalates may 
harm the health of children, causing 
possible damage to their reproductive 
system.  The product does not comply 
with the REACH Regulation. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A12/00383/22 Poland Plastic Doll 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical 
The plastic material of the toy contains 
bis (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate (DEHP) 
(measured value:  up to 13.5% by 
weight).  This phthalate may harm the 
health of children, causing possible 
damage to the reproductive system.  
The product does not comply with the 
REACH Regulation. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005201
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005628
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10004964
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005677
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005704
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A12/00387/22 Poland Rattle Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
Czechia) 

 Choking 
Some parts of the toy protrude.  If a 
child puts the toy in the mouth, the 
protruding parts could obstruct the 
airways and cause choking.  The 
product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN-71-1. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00389/22 Poland Expandable 
Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking, Injury 
The duck figurine can be put into the 
mouth and swallowed by children.  As 
this figurine expands, it can cause fatal 
occlusion of the respiratory tract or 
intestinal blockage of the children.  The 
product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00390/22 France Fancy 
Dress  
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Strangulation, Suffocation 
The product has long non-detachable 
functional cords in the neck area, in 
which a child can become trapped 
during various activities, leading to 
strangulation.  Moreover, the plastic 
bag is too thin, which could lead to 
suffocation if a child play with it.  The 
product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A12/00391/22 Sweden Inflatable 
Swimming 
Pool 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical 
The plastic material of the product 
contains an excessive amount of  
bis (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate (DEHP) 
(measured value:  up to 22% by 
weight).  This phthalate may harm the 
health of children, causing possible 
damage to their reproductive system. 
The product does not comply with the 
REACH Regulation. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

  

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005719
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005714
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10002981
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005180
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A12/00402/22 Germany Plastic Doll 
Set 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical 
The plastic material of the doll contains 
an excessive amount of  
bis (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate (DEHP) and 
dibutyl phthalate (DBP) (measured 
value:  up to 7.45% and 5.95% by 
weight respectively).  These phthalates 
may harm the health of children, 
causing possible damage to their 
reproductive system.  The product does 
not comply with the REACH Regulation. 

Ban on the 
marketing of 
the product 
and any 
accompanying 
measures 

A12/00406/22 Italy Plastic Doll 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical 
The plastic material of the product 
contains an excessive amount of 
diisononyl phthalate (DINP), dibutyl 
phthalate (DBP) and bis (2-ethylhexyl) 
phthalate (DEHP) (total measured 
value:  up to 7.5% by weight).  These 
phthalates may harm the health of 
children, causing possible damage to 
their reproductive system and liver.  
The product does not comply with the 
REACH Regulation. 

Import 
rejected at 
border 

A12/00427/22 The 
Netherlands 

Soother 
Holder 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
Germany) 

 Choking 
The soother holder breaks easily and 
generates small parts.  A small child 
could put them in the mouth and 
choke.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the General 
Product Safety Directive and the 
European standard EN 12586. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00428/22 Poland Rattle Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
The handle of the rattle is too long and 
if a child puts it in the mouth it can 
block the airways and cause choking.  
The product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00429/22 Poland Soft Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
Small parts (eye, zipper, sequins) may 
easily detach from the toy.  The fibrous 
stuffing material of the toy is easily 
accessible.  A child may put small parts 
and the stuffing in the mouth and 
choke on them.  The product does not 
comply with the requirements of the 
Toy Safety Directive and the European 
standard EN 71-1. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

  

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005658
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005710
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005759
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005744
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005745
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A12/00438/22 The 
Netherlands 

Soother 
Holder 
 
(Country of 
Origin: The 

Netherlands) 

 Choking 
The product can easily break releasing 
small parts.  A small child may put them 
in the mouth and choke.  The product 
does not comply with the requirements 
of the General Product Safety Directive. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00441/22 Ireland Toy Car 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Suffocation 
The plastic bag is too thin, which could 
lead to suffocation if a child play with it. 
The product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A12/00443/22 Ireland Plastic Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Suffocation 
The plastic of the packaging is too thin.  
If a child play with it, the plastic can 
cover the mouth and nose, causing the 
child to suffocate.  The product does 
not comply with the requirements of 
the Toy Safety Directive and the 
European standard EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

A12/00444/22 Ireland Toy Set 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
The product has small detachable parts 
(balls) which a small child can easily 
access, put in the mouth and choke.  
The product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Stop of sales 

A12/00449/22 France Finger 
Paint Set 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical 
There is an excessive migration for 
aluminium and copper (measured 
value:  up to 2612 mg/kg and 296 
mg/kg respectively).  Aluminium is toxic 
for children if ingested.  Exposure to 
excessive levels of copper can induce 
nausea, vomiting and/or abdominal 
pain and kidney and liver damage.  The 
product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standards 
EN 71-1, 71-3 and 71-7. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

  

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005763
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005760
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005761
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005737
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005769
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A12/00453/22 Poland Plastic Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking, Damage to hearing 
The sound pressure level is too high 
(measured value:  up to 112.5 dB).  This 
could lead to permanent or partial 
hearing loss, when the product is used.  
Small parts (squeaking elements) may 
easily detach from the toy.  A small 
child may put them or the stuffing in 
the mouth and choke.  The product 
does not comply with the requirements 
of the Toy Safety Directive and the 
European standard EN 71-1. 

Withdrawal of 
the product 
from the 
market 

A12/00454/22 Luxembourg Soft Toy  
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
The product has small parts (eye and 
nose) that can easily detach.  A small 
child may put them in the mouth and 
choke.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Ban on the 
marketing of 
the product 
and any 
accompanying 
measures 

A12/00468/22 Luxembourg Soft Toy 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Choking 
Small parts can easily detach (eyes).  A 
small child may put them in the mouth 
and choke.  The product does not 
comply with the requirements of the 
Toy Safety Directive and the European 
standard EN71-1. 

Ban on the 
marketing of 
the product 
and any 
accompanying 
measures 

A12/00477/22 Ireland Toy Gun 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Chemical, Choking, Environment 
The plastic material of the product 
contains an excessive amount of 
organic tin (TBT) (measured value:  23 
mg/kg).  TBT is potentially persistent, 
bioaccumulative and toxic for the 
environment.  The product also 
contains an excessive amount of  
bis (2-ethylhexyl) phthalate (DEHP), 
diisobutyl phthalate (DIBP) and dibutyl 
phthalate (DBP) (measured value:  up 
to 1.3%, 0.13% and 7.7% by weight 
respectively).  These phthalates may 
harm the health of children, possibly 
causing damage to their reproductive 
system.  In addition, small parts can 
easily detach (suction cups).  A child 
may put them in the mouth and choke.  
The product does not comply with the 
REACH regulation and the European 
standards EN 71-1 and EN 71-3. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

  

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005796
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005734
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005733
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005740
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A12/00478/22 Ireland Inflatable 
Toy Set 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
Unknown) 

 Choking, Suffocation 
Small parts can easily detach 
(stoppers).  Consequently, a child may 
put them in the mouth and choke.  In 
addition, the plastic of the packaging is 
too thin.  If a child play with it, the 
plastic can cover the mouth and nose, 
causing the child to suffocate.  The 
product does not comply with the 
requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

INFO/00019/22 Ireland Toy Water 
Pistol 
 
(Country of 
Origin: 
China) 

 Warning Failure 
The toy is not accompanied by the 
required information from the 
economic operator and the warning 
texts are too small to read.  
Consequently, consumers are not 
informed about the safe use of the 
product.  The product does not comply 
with the requirements of the Toy Safety 
Directive and the European standard 
EN 71-1. 

Removal of 
this product 
listing by the 
online 
marketplace 

 
 

Safety Gate:  the EU rapid alert system for dangerous non-food products 
 
“Safety Gate”, the EU rapid alert system (formerly known as ‘RAPEX’), enables the rapid exchange of information between 31 
European countries and the European Commission on non- food dangerous products found on the market posing a risk to health 
and safety of consumers.  
 
A weekly overview of the alerts on those products is published in English for free on https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-
alerts/screen/webReport#weeklyReports. The measures taken in the notifying country in order to restrict their marketing or use 
can be ordered by national authorities (“compulsory measures”) or be taken directly by producers and distributors (“voluntary 
measures”).  
 

The official contact points of the Member and EFTA-EEA States provide the information published in these weekly overviews. Under 
the terms of Annex II.10 of the General Product Safety Directive (2001/95/EC) responsibility for the information provided lies with 
the notifying party. The Commission does not take any responsibility for the accuracy of the information provided. 

  

https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005757
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport/alertDetail/10005776
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport#weeklyReports
https://ec.europa.eu/safety-gate-alerts/screen/webReport#weeklyReports
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Recall Summary – US Toys / Children’s Products 
 

 
CPSC Recall List (Mar 2022) 

Recall 
No. 

Notifying 
Country 

Product Product Photo Hazard/ Risk Remedy 

22-090 USA Bee Happy 12 Days of 
Craft Advent 
Calendars 
 
 
(Country of Origin: 
China) 

 Poisoning Hazard 
Surface paint on the 
brown bell found in “Day 
10” of the advent calendar 
contains levels of lead that 
exceed the federal lead 
paint ban, posing a risk of 
lead poisoning. 

Consumers should 
immediately take the 
recalled advent calendars 
away from children and 
contact ALDI for a full 
refund 

22-095 USA Be the Band Music 
Sets 
 
(Country of Origin: 
China) 

 Choking and Suffocation 
Hazards 
The maracas can break or 
become unscrewed and 
release the metal beads 
inside, posing choking and 
suffocation hazards to 
young children. 

Consumers should 
immediately stop using the 
recalled Be the Band Music 
Sets and contact Crate and 
Barrel for instructions on 
how to receive a refund in 
the form of a $20 store 
credit for the maracas.  
Crate and Barrel is 
contacting all known 
purchasers directly. 

22-100 USA Sirrus, Sirrus X and 
Sirrus Sport Bicycles 
with Alloy Cranks  
 
(Country of Origin: 
Taiwan) 

 Fall and Injury Hazards 
The crank arm can 
disengage and cause the 
bicycle’s rider to lose 
control, posing fall and 
injury hazards. 

Consumers should stop 
using the recalled bicycles 
immediately and contact 
their nearest authorized 
Specialized retailer for a 
free repair.  Specialized 
Bicycle Components is 
contacting all known 
purchasers directly. 

22-101 USA DigitDots 3mm and 
5mm Magnetic Balls 
 
(Country of Origin: 
China) 

 Ingestion Hazard 
When two or more high-
powered magnets are 
swallowed, the ingested 
magnets can attract to 
each other, or to another 
metal object, and become 
lodged in the digestive 
system.  This can result in 
perforations, twisting 
and/or blockage of the 
intestines, infection, blood 
poisoning and death. 

Consumers should stop 
using the recalled magnets 
immediately, take them 
away from children and 
contact HD Premier to 
receive a pre-paid label to 
return the recalled 
products.  Upon receipt of 
the products, consumers 
will receive a refund. 

  

https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/ALDI-Recalls-Bee-Happy-12-Days-of-Craft-Advent-Calendars-Due-to-Violation-of-the-Federal-Lead-Paint-Ban-and-Lead-Poisoning-Hazard
https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/Crate-and-Barrel-Recalls-Be-the-Band-Music-Sets-Due-to-Choking-and-Suffocation-Hazards
https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/Specialized-Bicycle-Components-Expands-Recall-of-Sirrus-Bicycles-with-Alloy-Cranks-Due-to-Fall-and-Injury-Hazards
https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/HD-Premier-Recalls-DigitDots-Magnetic-Balls-Due-to-Ingestion-Hazard
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22-103 USA Toys Wooden Activity 
Walker – Walk ‘n’ 
Learn  
 
(Country of Origin: 
China) 

 Choking Hazard 
The wheels and wheel 
attachment hardware can 
detach from the walker in 
small pieces, posing a 
choking hazard to young 
children. 

Consumers should 
immediately take the 
recalled toddler walkers 
away from young children 
and contact Battat for a 
free repair kit with 
replacement wheels, 
attachment hardware and 
installation instructions.  
Known purchasers are 
being contacted directly. 

22-107 USA Ninebot Children’s 
Bicycle Helmets 
 
(Country of Origin: 
China) 

 Risk of Head Injury 
The bicycle helmets do not 
comply with the positional 
stability and retention 
system requirements of 
the U.S. CPSC federal 
safety standard for bicycle 
helmets.  The helmets can 
fail to protect in the event 
of a crash, posing a risk of 
head injury. 

Consumers should 
immediately stop using the 
recalled helmets and 
return them to Segway for 
a full refund.  Segway is 
contacting all known 
purchasers to facilitate 
returns using prepaid 
postage. 

22-735 USA Commencal Ramones 
14-Inch Bicycles 
 
(Country of Origin: 
Thailand) 

 Crash Hazard 
Federal regulations 
require bicycles with seat 
heights that measure at or 
below 25 inches to be 
equipped with foot 
brakes.  These bicycles are 
equipped only with hand 
brakes and can pose a 
crash hazard or a risk of 
injury to young children 
who might not be able to 
stop the bicycles using 
handbrakes only. 

Consumers should 
immediately take the 
recalled bikes away from 
children, stop using them, 
and contact the firm for a 
free repair kit.  Commencal 
Corp. is contacting all 
purchasers directly by 
email. 

22-736 USA tonies® Blocks 
 
(Country of Origin: 
Germany) 

 Ingestion Hazard 
When two or more high-
powered magnets are 
swallowed, the ingested 
magnets can attract to 
each other, or to another 
metal object, and become 
lodged in the digestive 
system.  This can result in 
perforations, twisting 
and/or blockage of the 
intestines, infection, blood 
poisoning and death. 

Consumers should stop 
using the recalled blocks 
with magnets immediately, 
take them away from 
children, and contact 
tonies for instructions on 
returning the recalled 
blocks for a full refund. 

*Source: www.recalls.gov 

 
 

https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/B-toys-Walk-n-Learn-Wooden-Activity-Toddler-Walkers-Recalled-Due-to-Choking-Hazard-Distributed-by-Maison-Battat
https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/Segway-Recalls-Ninebot-Childrens-Bicycle-Helmets-Due-to-Risk-of-Head-Injury
https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/Commencal-Recalls-Ramones-14-Inch-Kids-Bicycles-Due-to-Crash-Hazard-Recall-Alert
https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2022/Boxine-U-S-Recalls-tonies-Blocks-Due-to-Magnet-Ingestion-Hazard-Sold-Exclusively-at-tonies-com-Recall-Alert
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CPSC 
The United States Consumer Product Safety Commission (CPSC) is an independent agency of the United States government. To 
provide better service in alerting the American people to unsafe, hazardous or defective products, a “one stop shop” for U.S.  
Government recalls, www.recalls.gov, has been created. Publics can report unsafe products to CPSC by using the platform.  
 
The recall list is divided into seven categories: Consumer Products, Motor Vehicles, Boats, Food, Medicine, Cosmetics and 
Environmental Products. Generally, the recall was conducted, voluntarily by the company, under CPSC’s Fast Track Recall program. 
Fast Track recalls are initiated by firms who commit to work with CPSC to quickly announce the recall and remedy to protect 
consumers. 

 
  

http://www.recalls.gov/
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Recall Summary – Australia Toys / Children’s Products 
 

  
ACCC Recall List (Mar 2022) 

PRA No. 
Notifying 
Country 

Product Product Photo Hazard/ Risk Remedy 

2022/19371 Australia Kangaroo Soft 
Toy with Cork 
Hat Accessory 
 
7 Inches Tall 
 
SKU HS4617C-7” 

 Choking or Suffocation Hazard 
The product does not comply 
with the mandatory safety 
standard for toys for children 
up to and including 36 months 
of age.  The corks are small 
parts that may pose a choking 
or suffocation hazard for 
young children. 

Consumers should stop 
using the product 
immediately.  
Consumers should 
return the product to 
the place of purchase 
for a full refund, or 
completely remove the 
corks for safe use. 

2022/19373 Australia Wooden 3 Ball 
Boomerang 
Rattle 
 
Natural Finish 
with Rainbow 
Balls 

 Choking or Suffocation Hazard 
The rattle does not comply 
with the size and shape 
requirements of the 
mandatory safety standard for 
toys for children up to and 
including 36 months of age.  
The rattle or small parts may 
pose a choking or suffocation 
hazard for young children, 
which can lead to severe injury 
or death. 

Consumers should stop 
using the product 
immediately.  
HappyGumnut will 
contact affected 
consumers.  
Consumers will need to 
provide evidence that 
the product has been 
disposed of. 
HappyGumnut will 
issue a full refund once 
this has been provided. 

2022/19374 Australia Montessori 
Wooden 3 Rings 
Baby Infant 
Rattle Natural 
Finish 

 

Choking or Suffocation Hazard 
The rattle does not comply 
with the size and shape 
requirements of the 
mandatory safety standard for 
toys for children up to and 
including 36 months of age.  
The rattle may pose a choking 
or suffocation hazard for 
young children, which can lead 
to severe injury or death. 

Consumers should stop 
using the product 
immediately. 
HappyGumnut will 
contact affected 
consumers. Consumers 
will need to provide 
evidence that the 
product has been 
disposed of. 
HappyGumnut will 
issue a full refund once 
this has been provided. 

  

https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls/banksia-glen-international-pty-ltd-%E2%80%94-kangaroo-and-koala-soft-toy
https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls/living-water-pty-ltd-tas-happygumnut-%E2%80%94-wooden-3-ball-boomerang-rattle-natural-finish-with-rainbow-balls
https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls/living-water-pty-ltd-tas-happygumnut-%E2%80%94-montessori-wooden-3-rings-baby-infant-rattle-natural-finish
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2022/19384 Australia Organic Wooden 
Baby Rattle 
 
Wooden Maraca 
 
Baby Rattle Ring 
Wooden 

 Choking or Suffocation Hazard 
The rattles do not comply with 
the size and shape 
requirements of the 
mandatory safety standard for 
toys for children up to and 
including 36 months of age.  
The rattles may pose a choking 
or suffocation hazard for 
young children, which can lead 
to severe injury or death. 

Consumers should stop 
using the products 
immediately, dispose 
of the product and 
contact Two Little 
Seedlings for a full 
refund. 

2022/19387 Australia Wooden Crochet 
3-Piece Set 

 Choking or Suffocation Hazard 
The rattles do not comply with 
the size and shape 
requirements of the 
mandatory safety standard for 
toys for children up to and 
including 36 months of age.  
The rattles may pose a choking 
or suffocation hazard for 
young children, which can lead 
to severe injury or death. 

Consumers should 
immediately stop using 
the rattles, dispose of 
them and contact Trapz 
and Co to receive a 
refund for the value of 
the rattles.  Consumers 
will be asked to provide 
evidence to Trapz and 
Co that the rattles have 
been disposed of. 

2022/19418 Australia Smiggle Fun 
Character 
Slapband Watch 

 Choking Hazard 
The product’s button battery 
compartment is not 
adequately secured, and the 
button battery is accessible.  If 
young children gain access to 
the button batteries and ingest 
them, they are may suffer 
severe internal burn injury, 
which can cause serious illness 
or death.  Button batteries also 
pose a choking hazard to 
young children. 

Consumers should 
immediately stop using 
the product and store it 
in a safe place out of 
reach of children. 

2022/19422 Australia Squeeze Bead 
Plush Animal Toy 
 
A Sensory Plush 
Toy with Water 
Expanding 
Polymer Beads 
inside the Inner 
Casing 
 
Product code: 
15058 

 Gastrointestinal Blockage 
Hazard 
The toy's inner bubble casing 
may burst and release water-
absorbing polymer balls.  
When exposed to liquid, the 
balls expand.  If swallowed, the 
polymer beads can become 
large enough to create a 
gastrointestinal blockage, 
causing vomiting, severe 
discomfort and dehydration 
and may need to be surgically 
removed. 

Consumers should stop 
using the toy and keep 
it out of reach of 
children.  Any 
consumer who has 
purchased the products 
from Australia Post or 
received the products 
as a gift should return 
the product to an 
Australia Post outlet for 
a full refund. 

 
 

https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls/two-little-seedlings-%E2%80%94-organic-wooden-baby-rattle-wooden-maraca-and-baby-rattle-ring-wooden
https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls/trapz-and-co-%E2%80%94-wooden-crochet-3-piece-set
https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls/smiggle-pty-ltd-%E2%80%94-smiggle-fun-character-slapband-watch
https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls/australia-post-%E2%80%94-squeeze-bead-plush-animal-toy
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Australian Product Safety System 
The Australian product safety system is to maximize the safety of good by the cooperation of consumers, businesses and 
agencies. This policy sets out the principles adopted by the Australian Competition and Consumer Commission (ACCC) for 
prioritizing and addressing product safety risks.  
 
Under the Australian Consumer Law, a responsible Minister can order a compulsory recall when there are hazards on the 
products. A voluntary recall could be conducted to remove the product from the marketplace when the suppliers become aware 
of unsafe or defective products.  
 
The ACCC administers a national recalls system for recalls of specific and general consumer products, and publishes all product 
recalls on the website https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls. 
  

https://www.productsafety.gov.au/recalls
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STC (Hong Kong Standards and Testing Centre) is a not-for-profit, independent testing, inspection and 
certification organization. With a global network of ISO/IEC 17025 accredited testing laboratories and 
nearly 60 years of experience in consumer product testing, we can meet your conformity assessment needs 
with highly efficient and reliable service. Our testing scope and capabilities related to toys and children’s 
products include but not limited to: 
 

 

EU Requirements 
⚫ EN 71 
⚫ Phthalates (EC) no. 1907/2006 
⚫ Nickel Release (EC) no. 1907/2006 
⚫ Total Cadmium (EEC) no. 91/338  
⚫ Lead in Jewellery product (EC) no. 836/2012 
⚫ Azo-dye (EC) no. 1907/2006 
⚫ Bisphenol-A (2014/81/EU) 
⚫ DMF (Dimethylfumarate) (EU) no. 2011/135 
⚫ Flame retardants TCEP, TCPP, TDCP (2014/79/EU) 
⚫ Package Waste Directive (94/62/EC) 
 

US & Canada Requirements 
⚫ ASTM F963 
⚫ CPSIA 
⚫ California Proposition 65 
⚫ 16 CFR 1501 
⚫ ASTM F2923 (Children’s jewellery)  
⚫ ASTM F2999 (Adult’s jewellery) 
⚫ US Toxic in Packaging Clearinghouse (TPCH) 
⚫ CCPSA - Toys Regulations (SOR/2011-17) 
 

Japan Requirements 
⚫ Japan Toy Safety Standard (ST) 
⚫ Japan Food Sanitation Law (JFSL) 

 

Australia Requirements 
⚫ AS/NZS 8124 
⚫ Consumer Protection Notice No. 6 of 2010 - DEHP 

 
 

Hong Kong:  hktcd@stc.group Dongguan:  dgtcd@stc.group Shanghai:  shtcd@stc.group 
Changzhou:  czstc@stc.group Vietnam:  vnstc@stc.group Japan:  jpo@stc.group 
U.S.A.:  usenquiry@stc.group Germany:  grstc@stc.group  
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